
FOI Request - Permanent Teaching Posts -  101003134731

1) How many Newly Qualified Teachers (NQTs) have been employed in primary schools and secondary schools in your region?
Primary
17/18 18/19 19/20 20/21 21/22
31 30 29 18 34

Secondary
17/18 18/19 19/20 20/21 21/22
9 20 16 18 38

2) How many Recently Qualified Teachers (RQTs) have been employed in primary and secondary schools in your region?
Primary
17/18 18/19 19/20 20/21 21/22
Not known* NK* NK* NK* 24

Secondary
17/18 18/19 19/20 20/21 21/22
Not known* NK* NK* NK* 23

3) How many permanent teacher posts have been advertised for primary and secondary schools in your region?

Please see second tab "Question 3 Posts Advertised" for this information.

4) How many permanent teacher posts have been filled in primary and secondary schools in your region?
Primary
Not held. We are unable to answer this question as any permanent teacher posts not filled have been re-advertised until an appointment is made. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held. 

*Not held. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.


