FOI Request - Respite Care - 101003136484

1) Yes
2020-2021 2021-2022 2022-2023
2 and 3) People Weeks People Weeks People Weeks *Data only for Adult Services (18+). Please see data for children below under "Placement Services".
Accommodated Respite 74 631.1 203 1902.7 96 1121.6 *We only record the breakdown if the Respite is Accommodated or Non-Accommodated
Non-Accommodated Respite 19 340.6 25 894.6 7 498.6
Adult Services (18+) 93 971.7 228 2797.3 103 1620.2
4) Not held. We have no recorded rejections. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.
5and 6) Number of Peo 20-21 Cost 21-22 Cost 22-23 Cost (to date) *Data only for Adult Services (18+). Data for children below under "Placement Services"
Accommodated Respite 373 £219,821.17 £577,089.79 £372,648.90 *We only record the breakdown if the Respite is Accommodated or Non-Accommodated
Non-Accommodated Respite 51 £24,153.27 £49,591.79 £25,085.38
Adult Services (18+) 424 £243,974.43 £626,681.58 £397,734.28

7 and 8)  All respite services are provided by third parties.

Placement Services

1) Yes
2020 21 202122 2022 23
People Weeks Cost People Weeks Cost People Weeks Cost
2),3),5) Accommodated 3 4 5600 2 5 7000 2 2 2800
Children and Young People

4) Not held. We have no recorded rejections. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.



