FOI Community Payback Orders 101003219866
Please provide me with details of

1. how many hours of Community Payback Orders (CPOs) have been carried out within the
council area in each of the last two financial years and so far this financial year

Answer - The following is the number of hours completed for those subject toa CPO with an unpaid
work requirement in the relevant years

20-21 - 16,575 hours completed
21-22 - 15,637 hours completed
22-23 10116 hours completed

a) Please break the figures down to show what offences these CPOs were carried out in
relation to, i.e. how many CPOs given to individuals convicted of theft, arson, rape etc.

Answer:- 20-21

Crimes of Dishonesty *
Crimes of Indecency *
Drugs Offences 6
Firearms / Vandalism *
Motoring Offences 33
Non Sexual Crime of

Violence 20
NULL 25
Other Offences 18
Public Order Offences 72
Schedule 1 Offences 2
Grand Total 184

*Due to the low numbers involved, this response is exempt from release as
individuals may be identified. This response is exempt under Section 38(1)(b) of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002- personal information.

Answer :- 21-22

Count of Offence

Row Labels ID

Crimes of Dishonesty 8
Crimes of Indecency 5
Drugs Offences 11

Firearms / Vandalism *



Motoring Offences 22
Non Sexual Crime of

Violence 21
NULL 24
Other Offences 19
Public Order Offences 69
Schedule 1 Offences 7
Grand Total 190

*Due to the low numbers involved, this response is exempt from release as
individuals may be identified. This response is exempt under Section 38(1)(b) of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002- personal information.

Answer - 22- 17 Jan 23

Count of Offence

Row Labels ID

Crimes of Dishonesty *
Crimes of Indecency *
Drugs Offences 5
Firearms / Vandalism *
Motoring Offences 17
Non Sexual Crime of

Violence 12
NULL 11
Other Offences 15
Public Order Offences 43
Schedule 1 Offences *
Grand Total 114

*Due to the low numbers involved, this response is exempt from release as
individuals may be identified. This response is exempt under Section 38(1)(b) of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002- personal information.

b) Please also break the figures down to show the proportion of the total hours carried out as
part of CPOs by the tasks undertaken, i.e. 140 hours of the total time carried out under CPOs
was spent picking up litter etc.

Answer : Not held. We do not collect these figures electronically; so we are unable to answer
this question to any accuracy. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.

c) Please also provide details of how many individuals carried out the hours of CPO activities
given in each year.

Answer :- 20-21 = 138 individuals; 21-22 = 127 individuals; 22-17 Jan 23 = 76 individuals



2. What activities have been carried out as part of CPOs handed out in relation to the offence
of rape and attempted rape in each of the last two financial years and so far this financial
year. Please provide what details you can on these activities, i.e. litter picking, decorating
etc.

Answer — No CPOs with Rape or Attempted in the timescale

3. Please provide what details you can to show how many hours of 'rehabilitation' measures or
non-work elements that have been undertaken as part of these CPOs by offenders in each of
the last two financial years and so far this financial year.

20-21 2084.30
21-22 3764.05
22-23 1409.30

a) Please break the figures down to show the types of rehabilitation measures or non-work
elements offered, i.e. what activities offenders undertook as part of rehabilitation measures or
non-work elements.

20/21

Completed
Row Labels Hours
Arrows 480:00:00
Asda Stores Ltd 52:30:00
Banff Buchan College 29:00:00
Children & Families Social Work East 61:00:00
Children & Families Social Work West 57:30:00
Cluny Primary School 18:00
Community Service Squad 52:30:00
Criminal Justice 57:00:00
Criminal Justice Group 232:00:00
Employment Support Service 167:30:00
Forres In Bloom (Fib) 20:00
Life Skills - Fair Start Scotland 104:30:00
Mcphersons Training Ltd 21:00
Moray College Uhi 324:30:00
Moray Community Foods 21:00
Moray Council 30:00:00
Moray Integrated Drug & Alcohol
Services 31:00:00
National Construction College -
Scotland 25:00:00
Open University 61:00:00
Penumbra 34:30:00
Quarriers Carer Support Service
(Moray) 37:00:00
Rinnes Medical Group 30:00:00
Survivex Ltd 32:30:00
The Employment Service 105:30:00

Grand Total 2084:30:00



21/22

Completed
Row Labels Hours
Arrows 309:30:00
Banff Buchan College 26:30:00
Children & Families Social Work West 58:30:00
Community Learning & Engagement 104:00:00
Community Service Squad 308:30:00
Criminal Justice 28:00:00
Criminal Justice Group 1171:40:00
Employment Support Service 350:30:00
Forres In Bloom (Fib) 62:30:00
Keith Health Centre 47:30:00
Life Skills - Fair Start Scotland 52:00:00
Maryhill Health Centre 43:00:00
Moray College Uhi 201:45:00
Moray Integrated Drug & Alcohol
Services 59:00:00
Open University 81:00:00
S C J Wellbeing Pack 860:10:00
Grand Total 3764:05:00

22/23
Row Labels Completed Hours
Arrows 72:00:00
Children & Families Social Work East 31:00:00
Children & Families Social Work West 23:00
Community Learning & Engagement 16:00
Community Service Squad 131:30:00
Criminal Justice 83:00:00
Criminal Justice Group 635:00:00
Employment Support Service 16:00
Forres In Bloom (Fib) 29:30:00
Life Skills - Fair Start Scotland 20:00
Moray College Uhi 52:00:00
Moray Integrated Drug & Alcohol
Services 19:00
National Construction College -
Scotland 18:00
S C J Wellbeing Pack 263:30:00
Grand Total 1409:30:00
b) Please also provide details of how many individuals undertook these activities in each year.
20-21 61
21-22 83

22-23 46



c) If possible, please also provide details of what types of offences individuals who undertook
these rehabilitation measures or non-work elements had been convicted of.

20-21
Count of Offence

Row Labels ID

Crimes of Dishonesty 14
Crimes of Indecency *
Drugs Offences 33
Firearms / Vandalism 17
Motoring Offences 45
Non Sexual Crime of

Violence 59
NULL 43
Other Offences 49
Public Order Offences 180
Grand Total 442

*Due to the low numbers involved, this response is exempt from release as
individuals may be identified. This response is exempt under Section 38(1)(b) of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002- personal information.

21-22
Count of Offence

Row Labels ID

Crimes of Dishonesty 36
Crimes of Indecency 8
Drugs Offences 26
Firearms / Vandalism 16
Motoring Offences 43
Non Sexual Crime of

Violence 47
NULL 51
Other Offences 52
Public Order Offences 199
Schedule 1 Offences 7

Grand Total 485



22-23 (17 Jan)

Count of Offence

Row Labels ID

Crimes of Dishonesty 29
Crimes of Indecency 5
Drugs Offences 25
Firearms / Vandalism 11
Motoring Offences 28
Non Sexual Crime of

Violence 31
NULL 26
Other Offences 33
Public Order Offences 111
Schedule 1 Offences *
Grand Total 300

*Due to the low numbers involved, this response is exempt from release as
individuals may be identified. This response is exempt under Section 38(1)(b) of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002- personal information.

4. What 'rehabilitation' measures or non-work elements have been carried out as part of CPOs
handed out in relation to the offence of rape and attempted rape in each of the last two
financial years and so far this financial year.

Answer — No CPOs with Rape or Attempted in the timescale. Information that is not held falls
under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not
held.

a) Please provide what details you can on what 'rehabilitation' measures or non-work elements
were carried out by these offenders.

Answer - N/A

5. Of the Community Payback Orders issued by a judge, how many hours' worth of unpaid
work were outstanding in each of the last two financial years and so far this financial year?

Answer — Not held. This information cannot be extracted from the system in the form that you
have requested. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of
Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.



