
FOI Request - Parking Apps and Paper Tickets - 101003310626
JAN - DEC 
2018

JAN - DEC 
2019

JAN - DEC 
2020

JAN - DEC 
2021

JAN - DEC 
2022

Notes:

1. How many parking PCNs  in total were issued for the following years? 1,590 1,321 483 1,003 1,576    These are Excess Charge NoƟces issued in off-street car parks
2. How many parking PCNs were issued where the driver used a parking app 
for the following years?

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
3. How many parking PCNs were issued by a civil enforcement officer for the 
following years?

1,590
1,321 483 1,003 1,576 All our Excess Charge Notices are issued by car park attendants

4. Where a parking PCN was issued and the driver used a parking app, how 
many parking PCNs were appealed then cancelled for the following years?

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

5. Where a parking PCN was issued and the driver used a parking app, how 
many parking PCNs were appealed then cancelled for the following years? N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

6. Where a parking PCN was issued by a civil enforcement officer how many 
parking PCNs were appealed for the following years? N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

7. Where a parking PCN was issued by a civil enforcement officer how many 
parking PCNs were appealed and then cancelled for the following years? 398 205 53 122 228

Moray Council introduced a Parking App in December 2020; 
however it is not recorded how the motorist paid for parking when 
Excess Charge Notice is issued

This information is not recorded.  Information that is not held 
falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 
2002 - Information not held.
This information is not recorded.  Information that is not held 
falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 
2002 - Information not held.
This information is not recorded.  Information that is not held 
falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 
2002 - Information not held.
This information is not recorded.  Information that is not held 
falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 
2002 - Information not held.


