FOI Request - Library Information - 101003513257

1) 1

Library

Aberlour Library
Buckie Library
Burghead Library
Cullen Library
Dufftown Library
Elgin Library

Milne's Learning Centre
Forres Library

Keith Library
Lossiemouth Library
Tomintoul Library

Mobile Library 1
2) 11
Library

Aberlour Library
Buckie Library
Burghead Library
Cullen Library
Dufftown Library
Elgin Library

Milne's Learning Centre
Forres Library

Keith Library
Lossiemouth Library
Tomintoul Library

Location

Burghead Primary School

Milne's High School
Forres House

Lossiemouth High School
Tomintoul Primary School

Location

Burghead Primary School

Milne's High School
Forres House

Lossiemouth High School
Tomintoul Primary School

Mobile Library 1
3)
2016 2023

Aberlour 16 16
Buckie 45 36
Burghead 11 8
Cullen 12 12
Dufftown 16 10
Elgin 56 56
Fochabers 29 10

Street

94 High Street
Cluny Place
Grant Street
Seafield Road
Balvenie Street
Cooper Park
West Street
High Street
Union Street
Coulardbank Road
Cults Drive

Street

94 High Street
Cluny Place
Grant Street
Seafield Road
Balvenie Street
Cooper Park
West Street
High Street
Union Street
Coulardbank Road
Cults Drive

Town
Aberlour
Buckie
Burghead
Cullen
Dufftown
Elgin
Fochabers
Forres
Keith
Lossiemouth
Tomintoul

Town
Aberlour
Buckie
Burghead
Cullen
Dufftown
Elgin
Fochabers
Forres
Keith
Lossiemouth
Tomintoul

Post Code
AB38 9QA
AB56 1HB
IV30 5UQ
AB56 4AF
AB55 4AB
IV30 1HS
V32 7DJ
V36 1BU
AB55 5DP
V31 6JU
AB37 9HA

Post Code
AB38 9QA
AB56 1HB
IV30 5UQ
AB56 4AF
AB55 4AB
IV30 1HS
V32 7DJ
V36 1BU
AB55 5DP
V31 6JU
AB37 9HA

Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019
Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019

Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019

Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019

(2016 Address in Q5)



Forres 45 36
Keith 40 30
Lossiemouth 34 16
Tomintoul 11 11
Mobile 29

4) 0

5) 1

Current Lossiemouth Library
Former Lossiemouth Library
6) 0

7)

Mobile Library Vehicle Removed in March 2024

8)

10)

2016-17
2017-18
2018-19
2019-20
2020-21
2021-22
2022-23
2023-24

11)

Since 1/11/2023

2018
60

0

2,068,000
2,184,000
2,234,675
1,988,314
2,006,151
2,139,000
2,584,000

2023

59

Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019
Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019
Opening hours Reduced following Library Service Review 2018/2019

Mobile library vehicle removed from service March 2024

Lossiemouth High School Coulardbank Road Lossiemouth V31 6JU
Town Hall Lane Lossiemouth 1Y3 | 6AA

New service model introduced to replace this service - home delivery & community pop ups

Data provided is as of 31st December 2018, historic data not available for 2016 - not held.
Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 -
Information not held.

Figures are not available as we are not at end of financial year

ltems
Value

462
4,945

Information is not available prior to 1/11/2023 due to changing to a new library management system - historic data is not available. Information that is not held
falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.



