
FOI Request - Fly-Tipping Data - 101003902857
1.  

Year/Mo
nth

2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

Jan 25 17 14 24 17
Feb 22 9 12 27 21
Mar 17 16 28 23 19
Apr 15 12 46 35 40
May 13 8 21 21 30
Jun 14 20 33 27 31
Jul 11 11 21 13 18

Aug 10 7 31 21 20
Sep 14 7 29 26 35
Oct 20 7 25 18 22
Nov 17 8 34 21 19
Dec 7 4 10 14 13

Total 185 126 304 310 285

Year/Mo
nth

2020 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

Jan 23 17 22 12 17 14
Feb 25 21 10 27 14 16
Mar 15 50 7 13 14 12
Apr 29 35 17 10 20 12
May 41 14 14 12 17 15
Jun 54 12 16 12 9 12
Jul 39 16 16 22 13 15

Aug 33 9 12 14 14 11
Sep 30 14 10 10 8 6
Oct 28 12 15 10 3 7
Nov 37 16 10 17 15 11
Dec 19 13 6 7 10 8

Total 373 229 155 166 154 141

In addition to this, the following complaints regarding flytippint were received: 
2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

33 41 37 29 37 107 196 141 127 175 211



2. Not held. We do not record what each item is, just use general titles such as: household waste, furniture, tyres, etc. therefore cannot give numbers involving mattresses. 
Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.

3. Not held. We currently uplift fly tipping within our normal collection vehicles when they are in the area so we do not have separate costings for collecting or disposing of fly 
tipping items. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.

Regarding Community Safety cost, however, in addition to anycost of removal and disposal, there  would be an average of 2.5 hours of Community Warden time for 
investigation = approx. £52.87 per complaint.


