
FOI Request - Elderly Home Care - 101003900912

Local Authority:
Date:

1. Who within the Local Authority, has the commissioning responsibility for 
domiciliary care placements? Please provide their:

Name Job title Telephone no. Email address

Senior 
Commissioning 

Officer 01343 563999
commissioning@m
oray.gov.uk

2. Please provide the total number of individuals aged 65+ receiving state-
funded domiciliary care services for the following financial years:

2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26 forecast

a.     Total number of individuals receiving state-funded care 1145 1053 944 933 958 N/A*
b.     Average number of hours of state-funded care received 380.9 438.7 423.9 421.8 404.3 N/A*
c.     Total gross expenditure by the local authority on domiciliary home care 8,721,960.00£         9,239,280.00£         8,003,000.00£         7,871,020.00£         7,746,040.00£         N/A*
d.     The number of new individuals receiving state-funded care 231 247 262 301 383 N/A*

3. Please provide the following information regarding individuals aged 65+ 
receiving state-funded domiciliary care services for the following financial 
years:

2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26 forecast

a.   Total number of hours comissioned for visiting care 436098 461964 400150 393551 387302 N/A*
b.   Total number of hours comissioned for live-in care N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A*

4. Please provide the following information regarding individuals aged 65+ 
receiving direct payments for domiciliary care services for the following 
financial years:

2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26 forecast

a.    Total number of individuals receiving direct payments from the LA for domiciliary 
home care
b.    Total gross expenditure by the local authority on direct payments for domiciliary 
home care 

5. Please provide the number of individuals aged 65+ for whom the local 
authority has arranged domiciliary care services where the individual is 
self‑funding and the local authority’s role is to arrange or commission the 
domiciliary care on the person’s behalf:

2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26 forecast

6. For those self‑funding individuals aged 65+ whose domiciliary care the local 
authority has arranged for the following financial years:

2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26 forecast

a.       The average hourly rate paid by those individuals for domiciliary care in each year

b.       The minimum and maximum hourly rates charged to those individuals in each year

c.    Any standard schedule of hourly rates or bands that applied to self-funding 
individuals for domiciliary care

7. If the local authority charges a separate "arrangement fee" or "admin fee" 
for arranging domiciliary care for self-funders, please provide:

2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26 forecast

a.   The amount of the fee in each financial period
b.   Whether this fee is one-off, recurring or structured in another way

Not applicable. We do not charge a fee. 

Not held. We know how many people get DPs but what it is used for is not reliably recorded. Information that is not held falls 
under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held. 

No Record. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information 
not held. 

No Record. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information 
not held

FOI Answers

Moray
22/01/2026

*Not held. We do not provide forecasts due to the nature of the data. 
Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of 
Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held. 


